
MEDICAL SUPPLIES TALLY

JANUARY 1, 2018 - DECEMBER 31, 2018

MINIMUM ORDER $100 $50

DESCRIPTION Ever Ready 

First Aid Quad Med

Concordance / 

MMS

Dealmed 

Medical 

Supplies

Mountainside 

Medical Henry Schein

NAO Global 

Health

2" N/S STRETCH CONFORMING 

GAUZE 

.85    12/bx          

6.80    8 bx/cs     

0200066

1.10     12/bx      

EFA-1000

30.40            

200/pk - 40/cs   

EMPGA221220

1.15   12/bx    

783102

1.23     12/bx    

14.81   8/cs      

3102

3.93    12/bg      

1048825

1.80    12/bg    

Henry Schein 

1048825

3" N/S STRETCH CONFORMING 

GAUZE 

.96    12/bx       

7.68    8 bx/cs     

0200067

1.24     12/bx     

EFA-1001

28.69            

200/pk - 20/cs   

EMPGA331220

1.30   12/bx   

783103

1.46     12/bx    

17.52   8/cs      

3103

3.11    12/bg    

1048997

1.44    12/bg  

Henry Schein   

1048997

4" N/S STRETCH CONFORMING 

GAUZE

1.08   12/cs        

8.30   8 bx/cs     

0200068

1.31     12/bx     

EFA-1002

22.16            

200/pk - 10/cs   

EMPGA441220

1.45   12/bx   

783104

1.71   12/bx    

20.53   8/cs      

3104

6.96    12/bg    

1042728

1.80    12/bg    

Henry Schein 

1042728

4" X 10" UNNA BOOT BANDAGE 

12/CS

4.54    ea   

54.00   12/cs      

DYN3454

44.49   12/cs   

DYN3454

5.40   ea   

345600

4.07   100/bx   

48.84   12/cs    

3454

6.80      ea     

1003256

3.87    ea      

Henry  Schein    

100325645

ACE BANDAGES 4" - SAMPLE

5.40   10/bx    

27.00   5 bx/cs    

0300030

3.88     10/bx    

EFA-1072

30.94             

10/pk - 6/cs  

CON33400000

23.34   10/bx      

3M  207433

ADHESIVE TAPE REMOVER PADS 

(PDI)

3.00   100/bx  

30.00  10 bx/cs    

MDS090855

33.18             

100/bx - 10/cs  

NICB1600

3.65   100/bx   

483622

3.69   100/bx   

36.90   10/cs    

B16400

4.32   100/bx   

PDI  B16400

ALCOHOL PREP PAD, MEDIUM 2 

PLY

1.45    200/bx  

14.50  10 bx/cs    

0100045

1.41     200/bx        

EFA-4150

26.42             

200/bx - 10/cs   

EMP22005

1.35     200/bx    

781010

1.44   200/bx   

14.37   10/cs   

1113

2.45     200/bx    

1126131

1.17    200/bx   

Henry Schein 

H51007

AMD 4 X 4 FENESTRATED DRAIN 

SPONGE

2.35   50/bx      

28.20  12 bx/cs    

PRM256000H

40.15              

24/bg - 3/cs  

KEN6242

.24     2/pk     

6783947

10.50    50/pk  

Coviden 7086

APRONS DISPOSABLE BIB STYLE

4.75  100/bx   

47.00   10 bx/cs   

DYN4403

4.49     100/bx     

EIC-5117

33.75   300/cs   

MEDNON24268

4.60   100/b   

440300

35.25    25/pk     

1007483

173.56   100/bx  

Tidi 10418

AQUACEL AG ANTIMICROBIAL 

DRESSING

169.26   10/bx    

CON420677

AQUACEL FOAM ADHESIVE 2" X 2"
85.70   10/bx   

CON420675

73.76   10/bx    

420639

AQUACEL FOAM ADHESIVE 4" X 4"
53.69   10/bx   

CON420680

147.54   10/bx   

420642

AQUACEL FOAM NON-ADHESIVE 2" 

X 2"

58.07   10/bx   

CON420639

64.70    5/bx    

177904

AQUACEL FOAM NON-ADHESIVE 4" 

X 4"

64.52   10/bx   

CON420633

112.35    5/bx    

403771

AQUACEL ROPE 3/4" X 18" - # 

177904 or equal

55.84    5/bx   

CON403770

68.46    5/bx  

Convatec 403770

AQUACEL AG ROPE 3/4" X 18" - # 

403771 or equal

97.28   5/bx   

CON403771

119.24    5/bx  

Convatec 403771

ASPIRA DRESSING KIT
131.25   5/cs   

BAR4991503

ASPIRA DRAINAGE KIT
318.18   5/cs   

BAR4992301

AUTOLOCK 1.75 OSTOMY POUCH
33.65   10/bx   

401502

AUTOLOCK 1.75 OSTOMY WAFER NO BID
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MEDICAL SUPPLIES TALLY

JANUARY 1, 2018 - DECEMBER 31, 2018

DESCRIPTION Ever Ready 

First Aid Quad Med

Concordance / 

MMS

Dealmed 

Medical 

Supplies

Mountainside 

Medical Henry Schein

NAO Global 

Health

AUTOLOCK 2.25 OSTOMY POUCH

AUTOLOCK 2.25 OSTOMY WAFER

BANDAIDS - SHEER - PLASTIC  3/8" 

X 1 1/2"

.85   100/bx   

30.60  36 bx/cs   

0300013

.99     100/bx      

EFA-1107

34.03            

100/bx - 36/cs   

DYN3608

1.04   100/bx    

37.44   36/cs   

3608

4.75      50/bx     

9870457

2.28    96/bx     

J&J 100563500

BANDAIDS - FABRIC  3/4" X 3"

1.75   100/bx    

42.00  24 bx/cs  

0300010

1.81    100/bx    

EFA-1106

25.20            

100/bx - 24/cs   

DUK7604

1.62    100/bx    

783810

1.85   100/bx   

44.40   24/cs     

3611

86.09    

1800/cs    

1271229

5.17   ea   Bard 

154002

BARD DRAINAGE BAGS - 2000mL, 

ANTI-REFLUX

1.45  ea          

29.00  20/cs  

DYN4271

105.91   20/cs   

BAR153504

29.50   20/cs   

427100

6.25  ea       

125.00   20/cs    

154004

5.16    ea     

8903207

2.50    ea   

Purdue 

BSOL04

BETADINE SOLUTION  4 OZ

.90    ea           

43.20  48/cs   

DYN1413

109.69   72/cs   

APL82-255

.77     ea   

141325

10.68   ea    

10691517

BIATIN 4x4 FOAM DRESSING, 

STERILE, NON-ADHESIVE

38.75  10/bx   

COL3430

BIATIN ALGINATE AG - 4x4
63.09   10/bx   

COL3710

BRAVA ELASTIC BARRIER STRIP - 

Coloplast

23.18   20/bx   

COL120700

38.26    20/bx    

20740

CASTILE SOAP TOWELETTES 5" X 9"

3.30   100/bx   

33.00  10 b/cs   

0100099

27.67           

100/bx - 3/cs   

NICD41900

21.76   1000/cs   

130400  5"x7"

2.33   100/bx   

23.30   10/cs    

1304  5"x7"

CHUX 17" X 24"

8.00   100/bx    

24.00  3 bx/cs   

0200018

21.20   200/cs   

EFA-5320

21.02           

100/bx - 3/cs   

DYN1341

18.05   300/cs    

784030

6.99   100/pk    

20.97   3/cs   

1340

16.25     300/cs  

henry Schein 

115633

CLOSED POUCH W/FILTER 2" - 

Hollister

41.18   30/bx   

HOL18323

COBAN, SELF-ADHERENT 

BANDAGE, 3" X 5YDS, TAN

.85    ea          

20.40   24/cs   

0300054

23.80     24/bx     

EFA-107803

38.74   24/bx   

3/M1583

24.50    24/cs    

317300

1.96  ea    

24.47   24/cs    

1583

3.52    ea    

7775640    

2.10      ea          

3M 1583

COBAN, SELF-ADHERENT 

BANDAGE, 4" X 5YDS, TAN

1.00  ea         

18.00   18/cs     

0300072

23.80     18/bx     

EFA-107804

86.31   18/bx   

3/M1584

22.50    18/cs    

317400

3.05   ea    

54.90   18/cs   

1584

4.09    ea     

7775476

2.85      ea           

3M 1584

COHESIVE SEALS - EAKIN # 839002 

or equal

120.00   20/bx    

CON839002

86.31   20/bx   

CON839002

105.00   20/bx   

839002

95.00   20/bx    

839002

135.13     20/bx    

1016126

105.88    20/bx   

Convatec 

839002

COMBINE PADS 5 X 9, STERILE

2.00    25/bx    

32.00  16 bx/cs    

1000025

2.30    20/bx    

EFA-1060

31.99             

20/bx - 20/cs  

DYN3501

2.15   20/bx   

783501

2.15   ea        

43.00   20/cs    

3501

5.98    25/pk      

1202048

3.15    25/pk    

Dukal 5590

CONDOM CATHETERS

18.90   25/cs    

DYND12301 

(S, M, L)

131.82   100/bx   

COL5100

1.33   ea    

9107

68.62     30/bx    

Hollister 9207

MALE EXTERNAL CATHETER

18.90   25/cs    

DYND12301 

(S, M, L)

30.66  30/bx   

HOL9107

1.33     ea   

9107

2.86    ea    

9312104

1.40   ea      

Mentor 8500-

8530

CONVEX SKIN BARRIER STRIP, 2 

1/4" WAFER - Hollister

38.02   5/bx   

HOL11403

DERMACEA GAUZE SPONGE - 2" x 

2", 8 ply

1.29    200/bg    

Kendall 441203

41.25   2/pk - 

25 pk/bx - 

30/cs  

4.21    50/bx    

441211

1.22      200/bg     

1149528

1.05     200/bg    

Coviden 

442308

NO BID

NO BID
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MEDICAL SUPPLIES TALLY

JANUARY 1, 2018 - DECEMBER 31, 2018

DESCRIPTION Ever Ready 

First Aid Quad Med

Concordance / 

MMS

Dealmed 

Medical 

Supplies

Mountainside 

Medical Henry Schein

NAO Global 

Health

DIGITAL ORAL THERMOMETER

1.75    ea       

21.00  12/cs     

103750

1.68      ea         

EDI-7449

5.06     ea     

DMI15-732-000

2.01    ea   

412000

8.36    ea     

3950234

65.56    25/bx    

Cardinal 16811-

ECD

DIGITAL ORAL THERMOMETER 

SHEATHS

2.20     100/bx    

103751

1.79      100/bx    

EDI-7450

5.43   100/bx   

MEDMDS9607

2.75    100/bx    

416100

2.79    100/bx     

1009361

2.99    100/bx     

Tidi 20633

36" DISPOSABLE INFANT TAPE 

MEASURE 1000/BX

31.00    

1000/bx      

GRA1335

55.80    

1000/bx     

81475

20.34   1000/cs   

TEM4412

25.50   1000/bx    

133501

22.36    

1000/bx    4412

62.99    

1000/bx      

1127022

28.13     

1000/cs     

_____

DISPOSABLE BLOOD PRESSURE 

CUFF & SPHYGMOMANOMETER KIT

44.86   ea   

AME774-

11ADH

7.25    ea    

786422

6.25   ea    

62.50   10/cs   

7107

45.58   500/cs     

1286081

DUO DERM CGF 4 x 4 

HYDROCOLLOID DRESSINGS 

178.00   20/bag    

187658 Convatec

33.07   5/bx   

CON187660

22.00    5/bx    

187660

40.56    5/bx    

Convatec 187660

DUO DERM X-THIN 4 x 4 

HYDROCOLLOID DRESSINGS

66.00      10/bx     

187955 Convatec

44.95   10/bx   

CON187955

32.50    10/bx    

187955

55.13    10/bx   

Convatec 1879-

55

EAR LOOP FACE MASK
3.30    50/bx     

EIC-5154

29.55        

50/bx - 6/cs   

MEDNON2737

2.25     50/bx    

784010

2.28   50/bx    

27.36   12/cs    

2201

40.01    25/bx      

1532528

2.70    50/bx    

Dynarex 2201

ALL SILICONE 14FR 5CC FOLEY 

CATHETER 

27.00   10/bx     

DYN5075

100.50   12/cs   

BAR175814

25.75     10/bx     

5075

2.38   ea    

23.80   10/bx    

5075

43.63    10/bx   

Medline 

DYND11501

ALL SILICONE 14FR 30CC FOLEY 

CATHETER 

27.00     10/bx     

DYN5083

12.82   12/cs   

BAR123630A

25.75     10/bx     

5083

2.38   ea    

23.80   10/bx    

5083

ALL SILICONE 16FR 5CC FOLEY 

CATHETER 

27.00   10/bx     

DYN5076

100.50   12/cs   

BAR175816

25.75     10/bx     

5076

2.38   ea    

23.80   10/bx    

5076

43.63    10/bx    

Medline 

DYND11502

ALL SILICONE 16FR 30CC FOLEY 

CATHETER

27.00     10/bx     

DYN5084

12.82   12/cs   

BAR123616A

25.75     10/bx     

5084

2.38   ea    

23.80   10/bx    

5084

43.63    10/bx    

Medline 

DYND11532

ALL SILICONE 18FR 5CC FOLEY 

CATHETER 

27.00   10/bx     

DYN5077

100.50   12/cs   

BAR175818

25.75     10/bx     

5077

2.38   ea    

23.80   10/bx    

5077

43.63    10/bx    

Medline 

DYND11503

ALL SILICONE 18FR 30CC FOLEY 

CATHETER

27.00     10/bx     

DYN5085

14.32   12/cs   

BAR123618A

25.75     10/bx     

5085

2.38   ea    

23.80   10/bx    

5085

43.63    10/bx   

Medline 

DYND11533

ALL SILICONE 20FR 5CC FOLEY 

CATHETER

27.00   10/bx     

DYN5078

25.75     10/bx     

5078

2.38   ea    

23.80   10/bx    

5078

43.63    10/bx     

Medline 

DYND11504

ALL SILICONE 20FR 30CC FOLEY 

CATHETER

27.00     10/bx     

DYN5086

12.82   12/cs   

BAR123620A

25.75     10/bx     

5086

2.38   ea    

23.80   10/bx    

5086

43.63    10/bx      

Medline 

DYND11534

ALL SILICONE 22FR 5CC FOLEY 

CATHETER 

27.00   10/bx     

DYN5079

25.75     10/bx     

5079

2.38   ea    

23.80   10/bx    

5079

43.63    10/bx    

Medline 

DYND11505

ALL SILICONE 22FR 30CC FOLEY 

CATHETER

27.00     10/bx     

DYN5087

12.82   12/cs   

BAR123622A

25.75     10/bx     

5087

2.38   ea    

23.80   10/bx    

5087

43.63    10/bx     

Medline 

DYND11535

ALL SILICONE 24FR 5CC FOLEY 

CATHETER 

27.00   10/bx     

DYN5080

25.75     10/bx     

5080

2.38   ea    

23.80   10/bx    

5080

43.63    10/bx      

Medline 

DYND11506
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MEDICAL SUPPLIES TALLY

JANUARY 1, 2018 - DECEMBER 31, 2018

DESCRIPTION Ever Ready 

First Aid Quad Med

Concordance / 

MMS

Dealmed 

Medical 

Supplies

Mountainside 

Medical Henry Schein

NAO Global 

Health

ALL SILICONE 24FR 30CC FOLEY 

CATHETER

27.00     10/bx     

DYN5088

12.82   12/cs   

BAR123624A

25.75     10/bx     

5088

2.38   ea    

23.80   10/bx    

5088

45.93    10/bx       

Medline 

DYND11536

FOLEY 14FR MALE STRAIGHT CATH
20.00      50/cs     

DYN4984

18.50   50/bx   

4984

5.16    ea     

8266885

48.28    30/bx    

Coloplast 28414

FOLEY 14FR FEMALE STRAIGHT 

CATH

20.00      50/cs     

DYN4994

18.50   50/bx   

4994

262.39     12/cs     

4673314

32.20    100/bx   

Rusch 

288300140

COUDE FOLEY CATHETER 16FR 

5CC

172.90   10/cs    

20516C Kendall

185.91   10/ct   

KEN20516ICC

189.00    10/bx   

Coviden 20516C

COUDE FOLEY CATHETER 18FR 

5CC

172.90   10/cs    

20518C Kendall

185.91   10/ct   

KEN20518ICC

189.00    10/bx   

Coviden 20518C

COUDE FOLEY CATHETER 20FR 

5CC

172.90   10/cs    

20520C Kendall

189.00    10/bx       

Coviden 20520C

FOLEY CATHETER TRAY 30CC
38.00    20/cs    

DYN4927

1.77   ea        

35.40   20/cs    

AS880

3.68     ea     

9620030

45.59   20/bx   

Bard 802030

FOLEY INSERTION TRAY, 10CC W/O 

FOLEY

34.00     20/cs     

DYN4926

1.34   ea        

26.80   20/cs    

4926

33.64   20/bx   

Amsino AS880

FOLEY HOLDER VELCRO - SAMPLE
72.00   50/cs   

DYN 4930

FOLEY URINARY EXTEN/CONN 

TUBE

20.08    ea    

1264551

21.02    50/bx      

Amsino AS311

FINGER TIP PULSE OXIMETER
18.00        ea        

SPOC12-P

23.40     ea        

EDI-700000

30.00    ea    

708869

30.00   ea    

7088

143.99   ea     

494744

15.92    ea  

Henry Schein  

MD300L634

GLOVES - P/F LARGE VINYL

36.90      

100/bx 10/cs    

EVR3003

21.88       

100/bx - 10/cs  

EMP5300L

2.65   100/bx   

787280

2.89   100/bx   

28.90   10/cs    

2613

6.55     100/bx    

5700090

3.26    100/bx   

Henry Schein 

VLG200

GLOVES - P/F MEDIUM VINYL

36.90      

100/bx 10/cs   

EVR3002

21.88      

100/bx - 10/cs  

EMP5300M

2.65   100/bx   

787270

2.89   100/bx   

28.90   10/cs    

2612

6.55     100/bx    

570089

3.26    100/bx   

Henry Schein 

VMD200

GLOVES - P/F SMALL VINYL

36.90      

100/bx 10/cs   

EVR3001

21.88           

100/bx - 10/cs  

EMP5300S

2.65   100/bx   

787260

2.89   100/bx   

28.90   10/cs    

2611

6.55     100/bx    

570088

3.26    100/bx    

Henry Schein 

VSM200

GLOVES - EXAM - P/F LARGE VINYL - 

ProCure # PC510 or equal

21.88            

100/bx - 10/cs  

EMP5300L

2.65   100/bx   

787280

3.52      100/bx     

1190353

3.31    100/bx   

Henry Schein 

5700090

GLOVES - EXAM - P/F MEDIUM 

VINYL  - ProCure # PC510 or equal

21.88            

100/bx - 10/cs  

EMP5300M

2.65   100/bx   

787270

3.52      100/bx     

1190351

3.31    100/bx   

Henry Schein 

5700089

GLOVES - EXAM - P/F SMALL VINYL  - 

ProCure # PC510 or equal

21.88            

100/bx - 10/cs  

EMP5300S

2.65   100/bx   

787260

3.52      100/bx     

1190350

3.31    100/bx   

Henry Schein 

5700088
GLOVES - SYNTHETIC - EXAM - P/F 

LARGE VINYL - McKesson # 

11111300 or equal 

35.22           

100/bx - 10/cs  

EMP5400L

14.29      

100/bx    

5658307

3.71    100/bx   

Baldur  5300L

GLOVES - SYNTHETIC - EXAM - P/F 

MEDIUM VINYL  - McKesson # 

11111300 or equal

35.22             

100/bx - 10/cs  

EMP5400M

14.29      

100/bx    

5654903

3.71    100/bx   

Baldur 5300M
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MEDICAL SUPPLIES TALLY

JANUARY 1, 2018 - DECEMBER 31, 2018

DESCRIPTION Ever Ready 

First Aid Quad Med

Concordance / 

MMS

Dealmed 

Medical 

Supplies

Mountainside 

Medical Henry Schein

NAO Global 

Health

GLOVES - SYNTHETIC - EXAM - P/F 

SMALL VINYL  - McKesson # 

11111300 or equal 

35.22        

100/bx - 10/cs  

EMP5400S

14.29      

100/bx    

5658049

3.71    100/bx    

Baldur 5300S

HIBICLENS LIQUID 4 OZ
5.90       ea      

57504

203.45   48/cs   

MOL57504

4.75     ea      

575040

4.94   ea    

34080002

7.21   ea    

1078796

5.09   ea  

Molnlycke 57504

HEMOCUE HB 201 

MICROCUVETTES 

295.00  200/bx  

4 vials   111716

203.45   50/bs   

HEM110723

180.00  100/bx  

111715

202.49     

100/bx    

1109167

81.82    50/bx   

Hemocue 

110723
HYDROFERA BLUE READY FOAM 

DRESSING - Hollister # HBRS4520 or 

equal

154.90   10/bx   

HBRS4520

84.09   10/bx   

HOLHBRS4520

162.85   10/bx   

504520

198.43   10/bx   

HBRS4520

153.28    10/bx   

HBRS4520

HYDROFERA BLUE READY 

TRANSFER 4" x 5 " - Hollister # 

HBRT4050 or equal

154.90   10/bx   

HBRT4050

84.09   10/bx   

HOLHBRT4050

151.50   10/bx    

504050

182.21   10/bx   

HBRT4050

153.28    10/bx    

HBRT4050

IRRIGATION TRAY WITH PISTON 

SYRINGE - AS136

22.00    20/cs   

DYN4268

.99      ea     

AS136

19.33   20/cs   

AMSAS136

.91    ea     

18.20   20/cs    

AS136

21.56   20/cs    

AS136

ISOLATION GOWNS YELLOW

15.00        

50/cs       

DYN2141

15.40    50/cs     

EIC-5101

12.50                

5/bx - 5/cs   

DYN2141

15.50     50/cs     

214100

13.13    50/cs    

2141

9.99      10/pk     

1011789

4.63   10/pk   

Cardinal 

1100PG

LEG BAG MEDIUM URINARY 600 ML

33.00   48/cs  

DYN4281 twist 

valve 500 ml

29.62   48/cs   

AMSAS306N

7.75   12/bx   

428100

.56     ea          

26.88   48/cs   

4281

44.68    ea    

8401682

35.26    48/cs  

Amsino 

AS308N

N/S 2 X 2, 8 PLY GAUZE SPONGES 

200/BG

.90      200/bg       

0200017

.91     200/bx     

EFA-1017

16.19           

200/pk - 25/cs   

EMPGA22820

.90   200/bg     

783022

.84   200/bg     

21.00   25/cs    

3222

5.73      10/bx    

8905018

.96    200/pk   

Henry Schein 

90-82821

2" STERILE KLING
.85     12/bg      

0200058

2.35     12/bx     

EFA-1004

18.07             

12/bg - 8/cs   

DYN3112

1.15     12/bx    

783102

2.64   12/bx    

21.12   8/cs    

3112

89.68    48/cs  

J&J 111613700

3" STERILE KLING
.95      12/bg      

0200060

2.74        12/bx     

EFA-1005

20.45             

12/bg - 8/cs   

DUK703

1.32     12/bx     

783103

3.10   12/bx    

37.20   8/cs    

3113

113.89    48/cs  

J&J 111613800

4" STERILE KLING
2.00     12/bg      

0200062

2.74   12/bx     

EFA-1006

22.50               

12/bg - 8/cs   

DYN3114

1.46      12/bx    

783104

3.33   12/bx    

26.64   8/cs    

3114

9.16    5/bx   

J&J 111614100

STERILE 4" KERLEX KLING - 

COVIDEN # 6715 or equal - SAMPLE

1.40   ea      

140.00  100/cs     

Covidien 675

.65      ea         

EFA-1008

127.84   100/cs   

KEN6715

1.45    ea   

671501

1.91    ea        

140.62   100/cs    

6715

1.54   ea   

Coviden 6715

3"X3" STERILE NONADH ADAPT 
31.00      50/bx     

SYS2012

6.38   100/bx   

3434

293.18            

50/ct - 12/cs   

SYS2012

25.62    50/bx   

307.44   12/cs    

2012

29.34   50/bx  

Systagenix 

2012

3"X8" STERILE NONADH ADAPT 
35.00      24/cs    

SYS2015

8.14     50/bx     

3438

405.00            

36/ct - 6/cs   

SYS2013

70.00   36/pk   

420.00  6/cs   

2013

33.73    24/bx   

Systagenix 

2015

LATEX FREE TOURNQUET - 

SAMPLE

.09        ea      

1700263

.88     10/bx     

EFA-350100

45.57   250/cs   

MEDNON7502

9

1.06   10/bg    

53.00   50/cs   

Techmed4408

9.56    100/bx   

Dukal NLT4100

LEADCARE II TEST KIT - #70-6762 or 

equal

350.06   48/bx   

ESA70-6762

375.00   ea    

706762

427.33    ea     

70-6762

MAGELLAN SAFETY NEEDLES - 25G 

x 1 1/2"

12.00  50/bx      

120.00  10 bx/cs  

8881850518

112.50         

50/bx -10/cs   

KEN88818505

13.10   50/bx   

850515

13.78   50/bx  

Coviden  

8881850215
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MAGELLAN SAFETY NEEDLES - 25G 

x 5/8"

12.00  50/bx      

120.00  10 bx/cs  

8881850558

114.77            

50/bx -10/cs   

KEN88818505

13.10   50/bx   

850558

16.19   50/bx   

8881-850558

17.05     50/bx     

6940028

13.78   50/bx  

Coviden  

8881850558

MEDIHONEY WOUND & BURN 

DRESSING # 31045 or equal

136.00  10/bx   

31045

535.13             

10/bx - 5/cs   

DMA31045

11.70  ea  

310450

138.16   10/bx   

628.58   5/cs   

31045

643.44   50/bx  

Derm Sci 

31045

MEDIHONEY GEL # 31805 or equal
64.00   10/bx   

31805

199.50             

10/bx - 5/cs   

DMA31805

275.00   40/cs   

318050

255.23   4 

bx/cs   31805

242.74   40/bx    

31805

4"x4" MELGISORB  - # 251100 or 

equal

312.50           

10/bx - 10/cs   

MOL252200

4"x4" MELGISORB AG - # 255100 or 

equal

127.00     10/bx      

255100

795.45           

10/bx - 10/cs   

MOL255100

93.30   10/bx   

255100

102.87   10/bx     

875.00   10/cs   

255100

95.46   10/bx  

ABCO 255100

7.2x7.2 MEPILEX BORDER SACRUM# 

282000 or equal

13.36      ea        

MOL282000

389.55               

5/bx - 8/cs   

MOL282000

55.00   5/bx   

282000

58.38   5/bx   

428.50   8/cs   

282000

467.46   40/bx    

Molnlycke 

282000

9x9 MEPILEX BORDER SACRUM  # 

282400 or equal

509.00   25/bx       

SCP282400

382.39             

5/bx - 5/cs   

MOL282400

86.15  5/bx   

282400

99.18   5/bx   

420.62  5/cs   

282400

467.50   25/bx  

Molnlycke 

282400

5x8 MEPILEX HEEL FOAM 

DRESSING # 288100 or equal

80.00    5/bx     

288100

284.09             

5/bx - 5/cs   

MOL288100

65.50   5/bx   

288100

62.50   5/bx   

288100

6x8 MEPILEX TRANSFER # 294899 or 

equal

12.90   ea     

294899

382.55               

5/bx - 8/cs   

MOL294899

425.00   40/cs   

294899

64.82   5/bx   

420.82  8/cs   

294899

467.50   25/bx   

Molnlycke 

294899

2" MEFIX SELF-ADHESIVE FABRIC 

TAPE # 310599 or equal

7.54    ea     

310599

189.55  40/cs   

MOL310599

208.55   40/bx   

310599

15.00  ea   

208.50  40/cs   

310599

5.69   ea    

Molnlycke 

310599

4" MEFIX SELF-ADHESIVE FABRIC 

TAPE # 311099 or equal

11.54     ea    

311099

175.68  20/cs   

MOL311099

198.75   20/cs   

311099

18.02   ea   

193.25   20/cs   

311099

10.54    ea     

Molylycke 

311099

4"x4" MEPILEX FOAM DRESSING # 

294199 or equal

6.72    ea       

33.60  5/bx   

MON294199

330.11               

5/bx - 14/cs  

MOL294199

29.50   5/bx     

294199

35.76   5/bx   

363.12   14/cs   

294199

28.30   5/bx    

Molnlycke 

294199

6"x6" MEPILEX BORDER FOAM 

DRESSING # 295400 or equal

10.54   ea     

52.70   5/bx     

MOL295400

380.68              

5/bx - 10/cs   

MOL295400

44.00    5/bx    

295400

41.87   5/bx   

295400

45.68   5/bx   

Molnlycke 

295400

4"x4" MEPILEX BORDER FOAM 

DRESSING # 295300 or equal

6.36    ea       

31.80  5/bx    

MON295300

224.43             

5/bx - 10/cs   

MOL295300

25.00    5/bx    

295301

34.40   5/bx   

246.87   10/cs   

295300

26.93   5/bx   

Molnlycke 

295300

3"x3" MEPILEX BORDER FOAM 

DRESSING # 295200 or equal

4.90     ea       

24.50   5/bx  

MON295200

230.68              

5/bx - 14/cs   

MOL295200

18.55    5/bx    

295201

27.25   5/bx   

253.75   14/cs   

295200

19.78   5/bx  

Molnycke  

295200
4"x4" MEPILEX BORDER AG 

ABORBENT ANTIMICROBIAL 

BORDER FOAM DRESSING # 395390 

105.00   5/bx   

MOL395390

700.00              

5/bx - 10/cs   

MOL395390

775.00   50/cs   

395390

91.37   5/bx   

770.00   10/cs   

395390

84.00   5/bx  

Molnlyncke  

395390
6"x6" MEPILEX BORDER AG 

ABORBENT ANTIMICROBIAL 

BORDER FOAM DRESSING # 395490 

185.00   5/bx    

MON395490

1,493.18             

5/bx - 10/cs   

MOL395490

1,600.00   

50/cs   395490

1,642.00     

5/bx-10/cs   

395490

179.18   5/bx    

Molnlycke 

395490
7.2"x7.2"  MEPILEX BORDER 

SACRUM AG ABORBENT 

ANTIMICROBIAL BORDER FOAM 

DRESSING # 382090 or equal

318.00   5/bx   

382090

1,602.27             

5/bx - 8/cs   

MOL392090

1,719.00   

40/cs   382090

1,762.00      

5/bx-8/cs   

382090

2,722.78  35/bx   

Molnlyke 

382090
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9.2"x9.2" MEPILEX BORDER 

SACRUM AG ABORBENT 

ANTIMICROBIAL BORDER FOAM 

DRESSING # 382490 or equal

1,490.91           

5/bx - 5/cs   

MOL382490

1,600.00   

25/cs   382490

1,640.00      

5/bx-5/cs   

382490

543.92   5/bx   

Molnlycke 

382490

MEPITAC TAPE 3/4" - # 298300 or 

equal

18.00  ea   

MOL298300

162.00   12/cs   

MOL298300

14.50    ea    

298300

14.85    ea   

298300

16.38   ea     

Molnlycke 

298300

MEPITAC TAPE 1.5" - # 298400 or 

equal

15.00   ea   

MOL298400

134.68  12/cs   

MOL298400

12.00    ea    

298400

12.35   ea   

298400

13.62     ea      

Abco 298400

MEPITEL ONE WOUND CONTACT 

SHEET 4" x 7" - # 289500 or equal

172.90   10/bx  

MOL289500

909.20            

10/bx - 7/cs   

MOL289500

955.00   70/cs   

28950

1,000.00         

10/bx-7/cs   

289500

155.87    10/bx   

Molnlycke 

289500

MEPITEL ONE WOUND SHEET 6.8" x 

10" - # 289700 or equal

190.00   5/bx   

MOL289700

1,159.09      

5/bx - 8/cs   

MOL289700

1,250.00   

40/cs   289700

1,275.00   

10/bx-4/cs   

289700

1,390.91   

40/bx   

Molnlycke 

MESALT - IMPREGNATED 

ABSORBENT DRESSING

1.54   ea  

285580

244.00       

30/bx - 8/cs   

MOL285580

265.00   240/cs   

285580

44.06   30/bx    

268.36   8/cs   

285580

36.60   30/bx  

Molnlycke 

285580

MULTIFOLD TOWEL (PACKAGED)

18.90 

12x200/cs    

DYN1310

36.82       

200/pk - 12/cs   

KCP01510

29.15   4000/cs    

400066

34.58   4000/bx  

Kimberly Clark 

01804

NEPHROSTOMY DRAIN BAG, 600 ML

10.36   ea    

202.04   20/cs   

RMG600D

134.72       5/bx     

678241

34.58   ea  

Merit Med 

S48MDD600

NORMAL SALINE .9% 15 ML

31.00   144/bx    

RUSCH      200-

69

43.70             

48/bx - 3/cs   

TEL200-69

8.25     24/bx    

526201

9.01       24/bx        

8510029

35.50   144/bx   

Smith Med 

R0159

NORMAL 0.9% SALINE 100ML
21.86   48/cs   

WEL6240

31.00    48/cs     

916240

.66     ea        

31.86   48/cs   

6240

25.66       

100/bx     

1200721

33.50    48/bx   

Medline 

RD130296

NORMAL 0.9% SALINE 500ML
24.14   18/cs   

WEL6280

2.38   ea   

520101

1.99      ea      

31.84   16/cs   

R5001-01

.02    ea    

1165301

NORMLGEL 0.17 oz

75.91             

10/bx - 4/cs   

MOL370500

NUGAUZE PLAIN .25 X 5 YDS 

STERILE

28.00    12/bx     

DYN3401

32.18   12/cs   
MEDNON255145

2.50     ea      

340100-1-4

1.65     ea      

19.80   12/cs    

3401

2.32     ea       

Derma 59121

NUGAUZE PLAIN .50 X 5 YDS 

STERILE

29.00      12/bx     

DYN3402

36.23   12/cs   
MEDNON255125

2.50     ea     

340100-1-2

1.75       ea       

21.00    12/cs   

3402

35.16   12/bx     

Derma 59221

NUGUAZE IODOFORM 5% .25 X 5 

YDS

32.00     12/bx      

DYN3411

31.82   12/cs   
MEDNON256145

2.82     ea     

341100-1-4

2.13     ea      

25.56   12/cs   

3411

NUGUAZE IODOFORM 5% .50 X 5 

YDS

35.00     12/bx     

DYN3412

26.78   12/cs   

DYN3402

3.05     ea     

341100-1-2

2.16     ea      

29.92   12/cs    

3412

2.89    ea    

Derma 59246

OIL EMULSION 5x9 NON-ADHESIVE 

ADAPTIC

105.27   72/cs   

KEN6116

26.25   12/bx    

157.50   6/cs    

2019

ONE PIECE OSTOMY 

TRANSPARENT CUT TO FIT 3/8" to 3"

35.57   10/bx   

COL10481
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ONE PIECE UROSTOMY 

TRANSPARENT CUT TO FIT 3/8" to 3" 

WITH VELCRO CLOSE

26.36   10/bx   

COL10494

84.54   20/bx    

Coloplast 

15521

OSTOMY POUCH CLIPS
32.26   20/bx   

HOL8770

19.43    10/bx     

51175635

OSTOMY POUCH 2 1/4" - 

DRAINABLE - Hollister

25.27   10/bx   

HOL8813

OSTOMY POUCH - CONVEX SOFT - 

Coloplast

42.24   5/bx   

HOL89111

OSTOMY SCISSORS
107.39   30/bx   

COL95050

PENIS POUCH
56.68   10/bx   

HOL9873

53.16    10/bx    

9811

PEROXIDE 4 OZ
.90     ea    

MEDHDX10

.88      ea         

EFA-410004

6.26   12/cs   

HYDD011

.63   ea   

112100

1.06      ea    

1280385

.52   ea  Henry 

Schein 112-7012

PHYTOPLEX BOTAINICAL 

NUTRITION FOR SENSITIVE SKIN, 

HYDRAGUARD SILICONE CREAM - 

Medline Remedy - 2 OZ

85.00   24/cs   

MSC092532 

93.65   24/cs   
MEDMSC092532

4.75   ea   

MSC092532H

4.14   ea        

123.60    24/cs   

MSC092532

57.23     12/cs    

1247653

PHYTOPLEX BOTAINICAL 

NUTRITION FOR SENSITIVE SKIN, 4-

in1 BARRIER CREAM CLOTH - 

Medline Remedy

103.00   12/cs   

MSC092534

43.64   12/cs   
MEDMSC092400

4

4.25   ea  

MSC092508

4.30     8/pk      

90.11   32/cs    

MSC092507

57.23       12/cs   

1247653

PICC LINE DRESSING CHANGE 

TRAY

4.00  ea    

DYND75223

792.61   50/cs  

TRIDT7095BP

12.30     ea    

2771297

12.32    ea      

DT7095

PISTON IRRIGATION TRAYS
21.00     20/cs      

DYN4268

36.49   20/cs   
MEDDYND20302

.98      ea        

19.60   20/cs   

4268

5.57    ea     

8310390

21.20    20/bx    

Amsino ASB6

PREP PADS POVIDINE IODINE PADS
3.25      100/bx       

0100022

3.55     100/bx    

EFA-4160

33.81            

100/bx - 10/cs  

DYN1108

3.60    100/bx    

110800

3.48    100/bx     

34.80   10/cs   

1108

6.39      100/bx     

2670098

3.88   100/bx 

Medlne 

MDS093917

PROFESSIONAL TOWEL, 2 PLY 

TISSUE/POLY, 13" X 18", WHITE

17.22   500/cs   

TID9810865

16.75    500/cs   

701051

15.80    500/cs    

1051

27.30       12/cs     

9030956

14.62    500/bx  

Tidi 1051

PURACOL PLUS MICROSCAFFOLD 

COLLAGEN WOUND DRESSING - 

4.2" x 4.5"

1,309.69   

50/cs   

MSC8644EP

1,050.00   

50/cs   

MSC8644EP

489.78       

50/cs    

8760589

1,003.39  50/bx  

MSC8644EP

PURACOL PLUS AG 

MICROSCAFFOLD COLLAGEN 

WOUND DRESSING - 4.2" x 4.5"

1,631.14           

10/bx - 5/cs   

MSC8744EP

335.00   10/bx   

874410

489.78       

50/cs    

8760589

1,574.40  50/bx   

MSC8744EP

REP BANDS - 50 YDS - LEVEL 1 

(PEACH)

50.67   ea   

NORNC91221-

50

67.00    ea      

10-1089

51.56      ea          

10-1089

71.54    ea     

1148119

56.96        ea        

10-1089

REP BANDS - 50 YDS - LEVEL 3 

(GREEN)

100.00     ea       

10-1091

79.68      ea         

10-1091

202.49   ea   

1148119

88.03        ea         

10-1091

REP BANDS - 50 YDS - LEVEL 5 

(PLUM)

130.00     ea      

10-1093

107.81      ea        

10-1093

138.14    ea     

1148119

SAFETY LOK 10 ML 21G 1 1/2
30.00     50/bx     

B-D305564

19.20     50/bx     

EDI-345240

110.00            

100/bx - 4/cs   

B/D309643

33.61      50/bx     

9879965

19.43   50/bx   

305786
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SANI-CLOTH PLUS WIPES, LARGE, 

6" X 6 3/4", 160/CAN, 12 CANS/CS

6.72        

160/cn     

Q89072

5.90        

160/tub          

EIC-410403

63.27        

160/bx - 12/cs   

NICQ89072

6.25   160/cn   

890720

5.86   160/ct   

70.32   12/cs   

Q89072

7.99      160/pk     

2670721

5.56   100/bx    

PDI Q89072

SANI-HANDS INSTANT SANITIZING 

WIPES - PDI P13472

5.90    135/cn    

PDI P13472

4.95      100/bx      

EIC-4109

55.86              

135/tb - 12/cs   

NICP13472

5.21   135/cn   

483637

5.18   135/ct    

62.16   12/cs   

P13472

5.65      135/cn   

PDI P13472

SHARPS CONTAINER 2.2 QUART
2.72      ea    

KEN1522SA

2.65          ea      

EIC-3549

135.92   60/cs   

KEN1522SA

2.48     ea      

148.80   60/cs    

1522SA

4.50   ea     

6660675

1.57      ea       

0322-150R-HS

SHILEY CANNULA XLT
65.02   10/bx   

MAL60XLTIN

78.02   10/bx  

Puritan 70XLTIN

SHILEY TRACH SOFT EXTENDED 

CUFF TUBE - 70XLTCP

80.63   ea   

MAL70XLTCP

88.68   ea    

70XLTCP

96.76      ea     

Puritan 70XLTCN

SINGLE USE SAFETY LANCET - 

Unistick 3 Comfort - Owen Mumfor 

AT1044

18.90   100/bx   

UNISTIK 3  

AT1042

21.75    100/bx    

EDI-3284-YL

23.86   200/bx   

OWEAT1044

27.35   200/bx   

AT1044

28.63    200/bx   

AT1044

NO STING SKIN PREP BARRIER 

WIPES 

1.65      100/bx     

EFA-4155

437.50   50/bx - 

20/cs   

UN159420600

200.00   

1000/cs   1503

6.88   500/bx    

137.60  20/cs   

1503

552.67      

1000/cs       

3372697

17.57     30/bx      

3M 3344

SPECIMEN CONTAINER 4 OZ 

W/SCREW ON LID, STERILE

18.00     100/cs      

DYN4253

33.41   100/cs   
MEDDYND30331

17.25   100/cs   

250400

.15     ea      

15.00   100/cs   

4253

9.24   100/bx  

Henry Schein 

900431

SKIN STAPLE REMOVER

.95    ea           

47.50   50/cs   

2700140

128.88   100/cs   
MEDDYNJ04058

.95    ea   

452200

.80     ea    

40.00  50/cs   

4522

3.27    ea       

7885805

.98    ea   

DYNJ04058

STERI STRIP 1/4" X 3" SKIN 

CLOSURES

25.00    50-

3's/bx     

1000030

154.91            

50/bx - 4/cs   

3/MB1551

31.50   50/bx   

715443

26.07   50/bx    

104.28   4/cs    

3523

72.15     50/bx     

1200942

46.91      50/bx     

3M B1551

STERILE COTTON TIPPED 

APPLICATOR 6" X 1/12" 

2.75     100 bx     

DYN4304

2.25       100/bx     

EFA-4411

2.15   100/bx   

430400

2.76   100/bx    

27.60  10/cs    

4305

9.29    1000/bx      

1009175

4.44    100/bx  

Henry Schein 

1009249

STERILE GAUZE SPONGES 4 X 4 8 

PLY 

22.90     600/cs     

0200013

1.41       25/bx      

EFA-1034

32.10            

200/pk - 20/cs   

EMPGA44820

1.50    25/tr    

36.00   24/cs   

3342

1.63       10/pk     

8905018

3.66    200/pk  

Henry Schein 

90-8292-1

STERILE GLOVES LARGE

15.90   50/bx   

127.20   8/cs  

DYN2433

36.25      50/bx     

EGL-539003

56.88                   

50 pr/bx - 4 cs   

INN106300

92.00   200/cs   

133900

12.29      

100/bx    

1070530

99.98   200/bx  

Innovative 

Health 133800

STERILE GLOVES MEDIUM

15.90   50/bx   

127.20   8/cs  

DYN2432

36.25      50/bx     

EGL-539002

56.88                  

50 pr/bx - 4 cs   

INN106200

24.75    50/pr    

133750

12.29      

100/bx    

1070502

99.98   200/bx  

Innovative 

Health 133750

STERILE GLOVES SMALL

15.90   50/bx   

127.20   8/cs  

DYN2431

36.25      50/bx     

EGL-539001

56.88                    

50 pr/bx - 4 cs   

INN106100

24.75    50/pr    

133651

12.29      

100/bx    

1070501

99.98   200/bx  

Innovative 

Health 133650

STERILE SPONGES 2 X 2, 8 PLY

36.00    

1500/2's/cs     

0200006

1.12      50/bx      

EFA-1030

68.18             

50/bx -30/cs   

KEN1806

1.29   50/tr     

38.70    30/cs    

3322

4.91    10/pk    

8905018

2.72    100/bx   

Coviden 1806

STERILE SURGICAL LUBRICANT

6.90  4 oz  

144/bx    

DYN1250

33.91    144/bx    

10120251

5.98   72/bx   

Dynarex 1251

STERILE TONGUE DEPRESSORS
3.40    100/bx    

1800033

2.66       100/bx      

EFA-4418

29.26               

500/bx - 10/cs   

EMP1001-6NS

2.75   100/bx   

431400

2.96    100/bx    

29.60   10/cs    

4314

10.29     500/bx     

1002416

4.22   100/bx   

Henry Schein 

1000238
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MEDICAL SUPPLIES TALLY

JANUARY 1, 2018 - DECEMBER 31, 2018

DESCRIPTION Ever Ready 

First Aid Quad Med

Concordance / 

MMS

Dealmed 

Medical 

Supplies

Mountainside 

Medical Henry Schein

NAO Global 

Health

STERILE WATER 100ml
21.32   48/cs   

WEL6250

26.00   48/cs   

916250

.61    ea    

29.28    48/cs    

6250

2.29    ea    

5075001

STETHESCOPES
2.00    ea    

143200

2.30       each       

EDI-7350-BK

3.43   ea   

AME662

2.42    ea   

929000

2.88        ea        

10-440-020

27.10   ea   

Henry Schein 

603BDHS

STOMAHESIVE PASTE 2 OZ
11.54    ea   

CON183910

8.22   ea   

CON183910

10.00    ea    

183910

9.96    ea    

183910

12.95    ea      

1963488

10.08    ea  

Convatec 183910

STOMAHESIVE POWDER
8.54   ea   CON 

025510

6.47    ea  

CON025510

8.85   ea   

925510

7.84    ea   

CNV25510

10.08    ea      

7731021

7.94    ea  

Convatec 025510

SUPER FLUFF 6 X 6.75 STERILE
60.00    480/cs     

NON25852

88.00   480/cs  

NON25852

52.67   240/bx  

Cardinal C-

S456625

SUR FIT NATURA CONVEX INSERTS 

1-1/4"

8.66   5/bx   

CON404010

10.61    5/bx   

Convatec 

404010
SUR FIT NATURA STOMAHESIVE 

FLEXIBLE CUT TO FIT SKIN 

BARRIER 1.75" WAFER - WHITE 

44.28   10/bx   

CON125262

54.32   10/bx  

Convatec 

125264

SUR-FIT 1.75" DRAINABLE POUCH 

12" OPAQUE

56.40   20/bx   

CON411491

28.85    10/bx    

401934

29.16   10/bx  

Convatec 

401507

SUR FIT NATURA UROSTOMY 

POUCH W/1.75" FLANGE

25.69   5/bx   

CON401557

29.16   10/bx  

Convatec 

401512
SUR FIT NATURA STOMAHESIVE 

FLEXIBLE CUT TO FIT SKIN 

BARRIER 2.25" WAFER - TAN

44.28   10/bx   

CON125265

52.50    10/bx    

125265

54.34    10/bx  

Convatec 

125265

SUR FIT NATURA 2.25" - 10" 

OPAQUE POUCH

23.76   10/bx   

CON401508

SUR FIT UROSTOMY 2.25 POUCH
25.69   5/bx   

CON401558

37.37   10/bx  

Convatec 

401536
SUR FIT NATURA STOMAHESIVE 

FLEXIBLE CUT TO FIT SKIN 

BARRIER 2.75" WAFER

44.28   10/bx    

CON125266

54.36   10/bx  

Convatec 

125266

12" SUR FIT STANDARD POUCH 

2.75" FLANGE

23.76   10/bx    

CON401504

29.16    10/bx  

Convatec 

401504

SUTURE REMOVER KIT

.54    ea          

27.00   50/cs  

2700137

1.40       ea           

EMI-9232

21.88   50/cs   

DUM4251

.50   ea    

452100

.51      ea       

25.50  50/cs   

4521

2.04   ea     

2677976

1.38   ea  

Henry Schein 

5822

SYRINGE 2 OZ CATHETER TIP
14.30     30/bx       

EDI-340137

21.87    50/cs   

4262

43.86    40/bx     

9876461

21.89   50/bx   

Amsino AS115

SYRINGE LUER LOCK 10 ML
7.50      100/bx     

DYN6990

7.09     100/bx     

EDI-340005

42.50            

200/sp - 2/cs   

B/D302995

7.25   100/bx    

866990

10.14    100/bx    

81.12    8/cs    

EXEL26265

16.39     100/bx    

9004476

12.76    100/bx 

B D 381512

SYRINGE LUER LOCK 20 ML
10.75     50/bx     

DYN6991

12.99      40/bx     

EDI-340130

53.45        

48/sp - 4/cs   

B/D302830

11.15    50/bx    

866991

12.11   100/bx    

121.10   10/cs   

EXEL26280

17.21      50/bx     

1126151

8.66   50/bx  

Henry Schein 

1126151

SYRINGE LUER LOCK 30 ML
11.90      50/bx     

DYN6992

11.20       50/bx     

EDI-340011

71.27               

56/sp - 4/cs   

B/D302832

12.50     50/bx    

866992

18.28    50/bx     

1126153

6.26   50/bx  

Henry Schein 

1126151
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MEDICAL SUPPLIES TALLY

JANUARY 1, 2018 - DECEMBER 31, 2018

DESCRIPTION Ever Ready 

First Aid Quad Med

Concordance / 

MMS

Dealmed 

Medical 

Supplies

Mountainside 

Medical Henry Schein

NAO Global 

Health

SYRINGE SAFETY LOK 3 ML 25G 5/8

18.90      

100/bx     

DYN6928

10.95     100/bx    

EDI-340530

173.91           

100/bx - 8/cs   

B/D309592

20.35   100/bx    

866928

43.75   100/bx    

262.50   6/cs   

10301

30.33      

100/bx     

9879538

26.09    100/bx  

B D 309592

TAPE TRANSPORE 1"
7.50     12/bx     

DYN3572

5.30      12/bx      

EFA-115401

95.23           

6/bx - 10/cs  

3/M1527-1

9.75   12/bx    

357400-1

10.50   12/bx   

105.00   10/cs   

1527-1C

18.69       12/bx     

7777305

13.48      12/bx     

3M 1527-1

TAPE TRANSPORE 2"
7.50     6/bx     

DYN3573

5.30     6/bx       

EFA-115402

95.23           

6/bx - 10/cs  

3/M1527-2

7.30     6/bx    

357400-2

10.50   12/bx   

105.00   10/cs   

1527-C

18.69        6/bx    

7779422

13.48    6/bx       

3M 1534-2

TAPE MICROPORE PAPER 1"
3.65     12/bx     

DYN3552

3.79    12/bx     

EFA-115801

49.55         

12/bx - 10/cs  

3/M1530-1

4.60   12/bx    

355400-1

7.00  12/bx   

70.00   10/cs   

1530-1

200.89     

400/cs     

1247525

6.96       12/bx       

3M 1530-1

TAPE, MICROPORE 2" X 10 YD 

PAPER

3.65     6/bx    

DYN3553

3.79     6/bx       

EFA-115802

49.55                 

6/bx - 10/cs         

3/M1530-2

4.60   6/bx    

355400-2

7.00  6/bx   

42.00   10/cs   

1530-2

12.54      6/bx     

7777936

6.96     6/bx  

3M 1530-2

TB SYRINGE 1ML 27 G X 1/2
14.35     100/bx     

EXE26040

12.25    100/bx           

EDI-340522

10.00    100/bx    

112713

8.03       20/pk     

8900433

9.34    100/bx  

Henry Schein 

904463

TEGADERM 2 3/8 X 2 3/4
23.00    100/bx     

DYN3642

24.85     100/bx     

EFA-3524

131.86        

100/bx - 4/cs   

3M/1624W

29.37   10/bx    

117.48   4/cs    

1624W

16.64      20/bx     

7776660

38.80    100/bx   

3M 1634

TEGADERM 4X4 3/4" TRANSPARENT 

DRESSING

23.00    50/bx     

DYN3643

24.85     50/bx     

EFA-3525

172.73          

50/bx - 4/cs   

3/M1626

34.06   50/bx    

136.24   4/cs    

1626W

71.99      50/bx     

7779551

58.62     50/bx   

3M 1626

TELFA 2" x 3" PADS
2.75     100/bx     

1000019

4.40      100/bx     

EFA-1046

234.22             

100/ct - 24/cs   

KEN6017

4.75  100/bx  

342300

12.37       

100/bx     

8900899

9.62    100/bx   

Coviden 1961

TELFA 3" X 4" PADS
4.40      100/bx     

1000020

6.30     100/bx     

EFA-1047

119.65             

50/bx - 18/cs  

KEN1050

6.78    100/bx  

342400

23.77       

100/bx      

8902865

15.53    100/bx   

Coviden 2132

TRACHEOSTOMY TUBE HOLDERS
2.18     ea    

DYN4620

27.27   10/bx   

DAL240

23.00    10/bx    

462000

3.96      10/bx     

240D

39.41      10/bx     

1267999

32.72    10/bx  

Dale Med 241

TRACH CARE TRAYS
26.00     20/cs   

AS860

21.66   20/cs   

AMSAS860

27.29    20/bx  

Amsino AS860

TUBE/CATHETER CLAMP
31.54   100/bx   

G/F3913-2

45.26       

100/bx       

1141712

36.76    100/bx  

Graham 3913-2

TUBIFAST SMALL LIMB - # 2434 or 

equal

12.00  ea    

TUB2434

9.57   ea   

MOL2434

11.75   ea   

1174

10.52   ea   

2434

TUBIFAST SMALL - MEDIUM LIMB - # 

2436 or equal

13.00  ea   

TUB2436

10.36   ea   

MOL2436

12.10    ea   

2436

11.40   ea   

2436

12.44    ea  

Molnlycke 2436

TUBIFAST LARGE LIMB - # 2438 or 

equal

16.00  ea   

TUB2438

13.19   ea   

MOL2438

15.75   ea   

152438

14.51     ea    

2438

15.83    ea  

Molnlycke 2438

TUBIFAST X-LARGE LIMBS, HEADS, 

CHILDRENS TRUNK - # 2440 or equal

22.00  ea   

TUB2440

18.16   ea   

MOL2440

21.25   ea    

2440

19.97    ea   

2440

21.79    ea   

Molnlycke 2440

TUBIFAST LARGE  ADULT TRUNKS - 

# 2444 or equal

49.00  ea   

TUB2444

39.09   ea   

MOL2444

45.00  ea    

2444

43.00   ea   

2444
46.92    ea   9

URETHRAL CATH TRAY W/14FR
36.00   20/cs   

DYN4925

5.16     ea     

6134266

2.59     ea  

Rusch 75735
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MEDICAL SUPPLIES TALLY

JANUARY 1, 2018 - DECEMBER 31, 2018

DESCRIPTION Ever Ready 

First Aid Quad Med

Concordance / 

MMS

Dealmed 

Medical 

Supplies

Mountainside 

Medical Henry Schein

NAO Global 

Health

COLOPLAST URINARY DRAIN BAG, 

2000ML, 20/CS

28.00  20/cs   

DYN4271

47.39   10/bx   

COL21356

1.75   ea    

427100

10.08      ea    

8902582

58.09     10/bx  

Coloplast 21356

VACUTAINER BLOOD COLLECTION 

SET SAFETY-LOK WINGED 

W/LUERS 21 GA X 3/4", 12" 

62.00     50/bx       

BD367281

12.30     50/bx     

EDI-301101

168.61         

50/bx  4/cs   

B/D367296

59.00   50/bx   

367281

66.41      50/bx    

9878393

VACUTAINER BLOOD COLLECTION 

SET SAFETY-LOK WINGED 

W/LUERS 23 GA X 3/4", 12" 

62.00    50/bx     

BD367283

12.30     50/bx     

EDI-301301

168.61        

50/bx  4/cs   

B/D367297

59.00   50/bx   

367283

66.41      50/bx    

9871301

VACUTAINER FEMALE LUER 

ADAPTER

139.05   200/cs   

B/D364880

264.85      

200/cs      

2448282

.84         ea           

B D 364880

VACUTAINER MALE LUER ADAPTER

338.64            

100/bx - 10/cs   

B/D367290

204.54           

200/cs              

B D 364902

VACUTAINER HOLDER REG
12.90    250/bx    

B-D364815

45.45          

250/bg - 4/cs   

B/D364815

13.15    250/bg    

364815

13.63     250/bg             

B D 364815

VANISHPOINT SYRINGE - 25G x 5/8"
72.00   100/bx   

10151 

190.91            

100/bx -6/cs   

RET10301

95.52   100/bx    

1203477

38.64    100/bx  

Retractable 

10301

VANISHPOINT SYRINGE - 25G x 1"
72.00   100/bx   

10161 

190.91            

100/bx -6/cs   

RET10391

95.52   100/bx    

1203477

38.64   100/bx   

Retractable 

10391

VIONEX 4 OZ ANTIMICROBIAL 

LIQUID SOAP W/FLIP TOP - SAMPLE

91.57   24/cs   

MET10-1504

100.73    24/cs   

10-1504

VIONEX NO RINSE ANTISEPTIC GEL 

4 OZ W/FLIP TOP

4.20      ea          

Vionex 10-1624

4.69       ea       

EIC-6405

93.85   24/cs    

100624

3.91   ea   

93.85   24/cs    

10-1624

7.62     ea    

3457243

4.22     ea    

Metrex 10-1624

WIRELESS WIPES - ANTIBACTERIAL

69.55             

20/pk - 48/cs   

NICP71520

XEROFORM PETROLATUM GAUZE, 

2 X 2, STERILE

13.90      25/bx   

CUR2532200

104.65            

25/bx -6/cs   

KEN88844334

13.11    25/bx      

1286077

20.93    25/bx  

Coviden 

H33400

XEROFORM PETROLATUM GAUZE, 

5" X 9", STERILE

38.54    50/bx    

CUR253590
 

44.15     50/bx      

EFA-105410

107.45           

50/bx - 4/cs  

KEN88844336

41.45   50/bx    

165.80   4/cs    

DKC20068

13.11    25/bx      

________

71.86     50/bx   

Coviden 

8884431605
PERSONAL DOUBLE ADVANCE 

PUMP W/O BATTERY - Medela # 

SYMPHONY DOUBLE PUMPING KIT - 

Medela # 67099W or equal

180.89   6/cs   

MDL67099-06

MINIMUM ORDER  $100 $50 

SUBJECT TO FINAL APPROVAL

NO BID
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